
P a g e  1 | 2 
 

City of Cody Contractors’ Board 
AGENDA 

 
Thursday, October 25, 2018 - 12:00 p.m.  

Meeting Place:  City Hall Conference Room, 1338 Rumsey Avenue, Cody, WY 
     

A. PROCEDURAL 
1. Call to Order 
2. Roll Call, excused members 
3. Approval of Agenda 
4. Approval of Minutes for the September 27, 2018 – Regular meeting 

 
B. CONTRACTOR’S LICENSES  

Conditional approval has been granted by the Building Official.  Board approval is 
required of the following:   
 

1. Modern Electric Co. – Richard Vignaroli 
Staff Comments: Staff has reviewed this application and reports that it appears 
to meet our minimum requirements for a Class B Electrical, 2018 Contractors 
License. (This Company was previously licensed with the City of Cody, but did 
not renew for 2018) 
Proposed Projects: WYDOT Project 
Action: Review and discuss – Approve, Deny, or Table application 
 
2.  Concrete and Up – Adam Aviles 
Staff Comments: Staff has reviewed this application and reports that it appears 
to meet our minimum requirements for a Class C Concrete, Drywall, Roofing, 
2018 Contractors License.  
Proposed Projects:  
Action: Review and discuss – Approve, Deny, or Table application 
 

C. Discuss the adoption of IRC – Draft resolution attached 
 

D. September / 3rd Quarter Reports – Graph / Chart Summary 
 

E. Active Commercial Projects:  
a. Mountain Equipment / Cleary Building 
b. 1949 Mountain View Dr. – Radio Station Remodel  
c. Rawhide Mechanical Building Addition 
d. Northwest Rural Water District Building 
e. RMI Doctors Office Building 
f. Western Hands – 1007 12th Street 
g. TE Ranch Aircraft Hanger – 308 Duggleby Drive 
h. TCT Airport Hanger – 3237 Duggleby Drive 
i. WYOld West Taproom – 1022 13th Street 
j. 726 & 732 Stone Street – Building / Storage 
k. 208 Duggleby Drive – aircraft hangar remodel 



P a g e  2 | 2 
 

l. 1220 Sunshine Avenue – remodel office building 
m. 2101-2109 Sheridan Avenue-New Mini-Mall 
n. 532 Yellowstone Avenue-Dollar Tree Remodel 
o. 619 16th Street – Gas Station to Coffee Shop remodel 

             
E.  Matters from Board Members: (announcements, comments, etc.) 
 
F.  Public Comments: The City Contractors’ Board welcomes input from the public.  In 
order for everyone to be heard, please limit your comments to five (5) minutes per 
person. 
 
G.  Staff Items 
   
H.   Adjourn 

 
The public is invited to attend all Contractors’ Board meetings.  If you plan to attend or need special accommodations to 
participate in the meeting, please call the City office at (307)527-7511 at least 24 hours in advance of the meeting to make 
arrangements. 
 
 



 

1 
 

City of Cody 
Contractors’ Board 

Thursday September 27, 2018 
 
A regular meeting of the City of Cody Contractors’ Board was held in the Conference Room of City 
Hall in Cody, Wyoming on Thursday, September 27, 2018 at 12:00 PM. 
 
Present:    Vice Chairman Richard Zickfoose; Donny Anderson; Tom Quick; Andy Cowan; Gene Kelly; 

Ray Lozier; Sean Collier, Building Official; Josh Dollard, Assistant Building Official; Todd 
Stowell, Community Development Director; Utana Dye, Certified Engineering Technician II, 
GISP. 

 
 Absent: Chairman Mike Kelly; Wes Werbelow; Merle Nielsen. 
 
 Vice Chairman Richard Zickfoose called the meeting to order at 12:01 p.m. 
 
Andy Cowan made a motion, seconded by Tom Quick, to approve the agenda September 27, 2018. 
Vote was unanimous, motion carried. 
 
Ray Lozier made a motion, seconded by Andy Cowan, to approve the minutes from the August 23, 2018 
regular meeting.  Vote was unanimous, motion carried. 
 
Sean Collier reviewed the applications for the following Contractors for the Board:   
   

1. Carpenters Handyman Service, Class C, Drywall, Framing, Roofing and Siding Contractor, 2018 
Contractor License. Ray Lozier made a motion, seconded by Tom Quick to approve the 
Contractor License for Carpenters Handyman Service. Vote was unanimous, motion carried. 

 
2. JF Custom Colored Concrete, Class C, Concrete Contractor, 2018 Contractor License. Andy 

Cowan made a motion, seconded by Tom Quick, to approve the Contractor License for JF 
Custom Colored Concrete. Vote was unanimous, motion carried. 

 
3. Double D Electrical and Instrumentation, Class B, Electrical Contractor, 2018 Contractor 

License. Andy Cowan made a motion, seconded by Gene Kelly, to approve the Contractor 
License for Double D Electrical and Instrumentation. Vote was unanimous, motion carried. 

 
4. Zach of All Trades, Class C, Framing, Concrete, Roofing, 2018 Contractor License. Gene Kelly 

made a motion, seconded by Andy Cowan, to approve the Contractor License for Zach of All 
Trades. Vote was unanimous, motion carried. 
 

5. Kromrey Construction, Inc., Class C, Framing and Siding, 2018 Contractor License. Ray Lozier 
made a motion, seconded by Andy Cowan, to approve the Contractor License for Kromrey 
Construction, Inc.  Vote was unanimous, motion carried.  
      

Sean Collier and Sam Wilde handed out the code changes for the IBC, IRC, and the IFC.  There was 
discussion on the handouts.  No action was taken. 



 

2 
 

 
The August Building Permits Report was reviewed by the Board.   
 
Sean Collier discussed active commercial projects. 
 
Public Comments – none 
 
Staff Items –  
 
There being no further business to come before the board, Andy Cowan made a motion, seconded  
by Ray Lozier, to adjourn the meeting. Vote was unanimous, motion carried.  
 
Vice Chairman Richard Zickfoose adjourned the meeting at 12:47 p.m.   
 
          
Utana Dye, Certified Engineering Technician II, GISP 







NRayes
Typewritten Text
SEE ATTACHED

















































 

RESOLUTION 2018 -  
 

A RESOLUTION ADOPTING THE  
2018 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, AS MODIFIED 

 
WITNESSETH: 

 
WHEREAS, the State of Wyoming has granted the City of Cody local enforcement 

authority for fire, building, existing building standards and electrical standards; 
 
WHEREAS, 9-2-1 of the Cody City Code states that the City will adopt by 

resolution the provisions of the International Residential Code that are in the best interest 
of the City; and,  

 
WHEREAS, the City of Cody desires to provide a common set of requirements for 

the building of residential structures covered by the International Residential Code. 
 
THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY OF CODY that the 

International Residential Code, 2018 Edition, including Appendices A, B, C, E, G, H, J, 
and the 2018 International Plumbing Code, ICC A117.1-2017 Accessibility Standard are 
hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof as though set forth herein, except as 
such portions are hereinafter excepted, modified or amended as described below:  

 
1. Section R101.1 Title, is modified to read:  “These provisions shall be known as 

the Residential Code for One and Two-Family Dwellings of the City of Cody, 
Wyoming and shall be cited as such and will be referred to herein as “this code”. 
 

2. The Exception of Section R101.2 Scope, is modified to read: 
The following shall be permitted to be constructed in accordance with this code: 

1. Owner occupied lodging houses with five or fewer guest rooms and 10 
or fewer occupants; and, 
The following shall be permitted to be constructed in accordance with this code 
where provided with a residential fire sprinkler system complying with Section 
P2904: 

1. Live/work units located in townhouses and complying with the 
requirements of Section 419 of the International Building Code. 

2. A care facility with five or fewer persons receiving custodial care within 
a dwelling unit. 

3. A care facility with five or fewer persons receiving medical care within 
a dwelling unit. 

4. A care facility for five or fewer persons receiving care that are within a 
single-family dwelling. 
 

3. Section R102.2 Other Laws, is modified to read:  “The provisions of this code 
shall not be deemed to nullify any provisions of local, state or federal law.  In case 
of conflict between this code and any other City ordinances or local laws that 
exercise control over the same feature, the more stringent regulation shall apply.” 
 

4. Section R102.7 Existing Structures, is modified to read:  “The legal occupancy 
of any structure on the date of adoption of this code shall be permitted to continue, 
without change, except as is specifically covered in this code, or the International 
Fire Code, or as is deemed necessary by the building official for the general safety 
and welfare of the occupants and public.” (Note:  Removes reference to 
International Property Maintenance Code.) 
 

5. Section R105.2 Work exempt from permits, Building: 
Exemption #1 is modified as follows:  “One-story detached accessory structures, 
provided that the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet as measured at the 
perimeter of all walls and roof supports (e.g. posts).” 



 

 
Exemption #2 (Fences) is deleted. 
 
Exemption #3 is modified to read: “Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet in 
height measured from the bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless 
supporting a surcharge or located within a public easement or right of way.  
Retaining walls within public easements and rights of way shall further require 
approval from the Cody City Council.” 
 
Exemption #5 is modified to read:  “Sidewalks and driveways on private property 
when not serving as ADA compliant means of travel.” 
 
Exemption #8 is modified to read:  “Private swings and other private playground 
equipment.” 
 
Exemption #10 is modified to read:  “Decks and patios not exceeding 120 square 
feet that are not more than 30 inches above grade at any point, are not attached to 
a dwelling, and do not serve the exit door required by Section R311.4.  This 
exemption does not apply to any covering (e.g. pergola or awning) or roof 
structure over the deck or patio.” 
 

6. Table R301.2(1) Climactic and Geographic Design Criteria shall be modified to 
read as follows. The “Manual J Design Criteria” portion of the table is not adopted 
as a required design process. 

 
  

7. Sections 2 and 3 of R302, FIRE RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION is modified as 
found in Exhibit A. 
 

8. Table R302.6 “Dwelling-Garage separation” is modified by replacing all 
references to “½ inch gypsum board” with “5/8 inch Type X gypsum board”, and 
the language of the last row of the table is modified as follows: 
Separation:     Material: 
Garages located less than 5 feet from a 
dwelling unit on the same lot. 

Not less than 5/8” Type X gypsum 
board or equivalent applied to the 
interior side of the exterior garage 
walls that are within this area. 

 
9. Section R302.7 “Under-stair protection” is modified to replace ½” gypsum board 

with 5/8” Type X gypsum board. 
 

10. Exceptions 2 and 3 of Section R302.13 “Fire protection of floors” is modified as 
follows: 
 
Exception 2 is modified to read: “Portions of floor assemblies located directly 
over a crawl space not intended for storage or for the installation of fuel fired or 
electric-powered heating appliances. 
 
Exception 3 is deleted and replaced with the following: 



 

“If a fuel fired appliance is installed in a crawl space, the horizontal assembly 
above the appliance shall be covered with 5/8” Type X drywall above and for a 
distance of at least two feet horizontally from the perimeter of the appliance, and 
any joints fire taped or sealed.  Penetrations of the membrane by ducting, 
plumbing pipes or electrical conduit or wires shall be permitted and all 
penetrations shall be tight fitting. 
If a fuel fired appliance is installed in a basement, the entire room shall be covered 
on the inside (walls and ceiling) with 5/8” Type X drywall and fire taped or 
sealed.  Penetrations of the membrane by ducting, plumbing pipes or electrical 
conduit or wires shall be permitted and all penetrations shall be tight fitting.  The 
door serving the room shall be a rated fire door complying with the standards used 
in Section R302.5.1.  If the underside of a stairway is in the same room as a fuel 
fired heating appliance, it shall also be covered with 5/8” Type X drywall.” 
 

11. Section R309.5 “Fire sprinklers” (garage) is deleted in its entirety. 
 

12. Section R313 “Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems” is deleted in its entirety. 
 

13. Section R320 “Accessibility” is deleted in its entirety. 
 

14. Section G2404.11 “Condensate pumps” is deleted in its entirety.  
 

15. Section M1411.4 “Condensate Pumps” is deleted in its entirety. 
 

16. Section P2502.1 “Existing Plumbing Systems” is deleted in its entirety. 
 

17. Section P2603.5.1 “Sewer Depth” is modified to read “Building sewers shall be a 
minimum of 48 inches below grade unless adequate provision is made to protect 
such pipes from freezing by insulation.” 
 

18. Section P2705.1 “Installation”, Item 3 is modified to read “Where fixtures come 
in contact with walls and floors, the contact shall be water tight.  Water closets 
(toilets) shall be exempt from this requirement in one and two-family dwellings 
and townhouses.” 
 

19. Section P2906.4 “Water Service Pipe”:  The following sentence is added as the 
first sentence of the section.  “Water service piping from the curb stop or meter pit 
to inside of a building meter or shut-off valve location shall comply City of Cody 
Code 8-2-7, or equivalent approved by the Public Works Director.” 
 

20. Section M1502.4.2 shall be modified to read: “Exhaust ducts shall be supported at 
intervals not to exceed 8 feet and shall be secured in place. The inset end of the 
duct shall extend into the adjoining duct or fitting in the direction of airflow. 
Exhaust duct joints shall be sealed in accordance with Section M1601.4.1. Ducts 
shall not be joined with screws or similar fasteners. Each vertical riser shall be 
provided with a means for cleanout located near the bottom of the riser.”  
 

21. Chapter 11 of the IRC is deleted and replaced with the following:  
 
Insulation and Fenestration Requirements for the City of Cody 

 
a. Ceilings with attic spaces: Attic insulation shall be a minimum of R-49.  
Baffles shall be installed in truss or joists bays at intervals consistent with the attic 
ventilation requirements of Section R806.1 through 806.4.   

 
b. Ceilings without attic spaces and unvented enclosed rafter assembles: 



 

Insulation and construction methods shall comply with Section 806.5.  In addition, 
for roof/ceiling assemblies which do not allow sufficient space for the required 
insulation, the minimum required insulation for such roof/ceiling assemblies shall 
be R-30.  This reduction in R value shall be limited to 500 square feet of ceiling 
area. 
 
c. Crawl Space Walls:  As an alternative to insulating floors over crawl 
spaces, the crawl space rim [walls?] shall be required to be insulated with a 
minimum of R-19 insulation when the crawl space is not vented to the outside.  
Exposed earth in unvented crawl space foundations shall be covered by a 
continuous Class I vapor retarder.  All joints shall overlap at least 6” and be 
sealed.  The edges shall be extended up the foundation wall at least 6” and be 
attached to the stem wall. 
 
[INSULATION DISCUSSIONS: 
1. Require insulation of crawl space walls, not just rim in ‘c’? 
2. If basement is unfinished, require insulation of the exterior concrete walls (or 

upper portions) if the floor above is not insulated? 
Why? Currently we have no insulation requirement for ducting in unconditioned 
crawl spaces and basements—effectively heating the area and not requiring any 
perimeter insulation in that portion of the building envelope. Coordinate with ‘d’ 
below.] 
 
d. Basement Walls Adjacent to Habitable Spaces: Walls shall be insulated 
so that the combination of concrete walls and insulation equals R-19 or greater.  
This includes rim joists cavities and behind tubs and showers. 

 
e. Floors: Subfloors shall be insulated with a minimum R-19 insulation if the 
foundation walls are vented per Section 408.2.  If unvented conditioned crawl 
space methods are used per Section 408.3 or automatic temperature controlled self 
-closing foundation vents are installed, the subfloor is not required to be insulated.   

 
f. Glazing: All glazed fenestration in habitable spaces shall have a U-Factor 
of .32 or less as documented on the factory sticker on each window frame. 
Glazing shall be double glazed in habitable spaces.  

 
g. Exterior Penetrations: All exterior door jambs, window frames and other 
penetrations shall be sealed by the use of caulk or foaming material to prevent the 
passage of air through spaces between jambs, frames and framing members.  All 
exterior wall base plates shall be sealed against the foundation wall or slab. 

 
PASSED, APPROVED AND ADOPTED THE (date) day of (month), 2018. 

            
 
                       __________________________ 
                       Matt Hall, Mayor 

 
Attest: 
 
_______________________________ 
Cynthia Baker, Administrative Services Officer 



EXHIBIT A 
 
Sections 2 and 3 of R302 are hereby amended as follows: 
 
SECTION R302 
FIRE-RESISTANT CONSTRUCTION 
 
(No changes to R302.1 Exterior walls?) Construction, projections, openings and penetrations of exterior walls of 
dwellings and accessory buildings shall comply with Table R302.1(1); or dwellings equipped throughout with an 
automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section P2904 shall comply with Table R302.1(2). 
Exceptions: 
1. Walls, projections, openings or penetrations in walls perpendicular to the line used to determine the fire 
separation distance. 
2. Walls of individual dwelling units and their accessory structures located on the same lot. 
3. Detached tool sheds and storage sheds, playhouses and similar structures exempted from permits are not required 
to provide wall protection based on location on the lot. Projections beyond the exterior wall shall not extend over the 
lot line. 
4. Detached garages accessory to a dwelling located within 2 feet (610 mm) of a lot line are permitted to have roof 
eave projections not exceeding 4 inches (102 mm). 
5. Foundation vents installed in compliance with this code are permitted. 
R302.2 Townhouses and two-family dwellings with units separated by a lot line. Walls separating either 
townhouse units or two-family dwelling units that are also separated by a lot line shall be constructed in accordance 
with Section R302.2.1.  Walls separating townhouses that will not be separated by a lot line shall be constructed in 
accordance with either Section R302.2.1 or R302.2.2. 
[Note: No changes to Tables R302.1 (1) or (2)]  
R302.2.1 Double walls. Each townhouse or two-family dwelling unit shall be separated by two 1-hour fire-
resistance-rated wall assemblies tested in accordance with ASTM E119, UL 263 or Section 703.3 of the 
International Building Code. 
R302.2.2 Common walls. Common walls separating townhouses shall be assigned a fire-resistance rating in 
accordance with Item 1 or 2. The common wall shared by two townhouses shall be constructed without plumbing or 
mechanical equipment, ducts or vents in the cavity of the common wall. The wall shall be rated for fire exposure 
from both sides and shall extend to and be tight against exterior walls and the underside of the roof sheathing. 
Electrical installations shall be in accordance with Chapters 34 through 43. Penetrations of the membrane of 
common walls for electrical outlet boxes shall be in accordance with Section R302.4. 
1. Where a fire sprinkler system in accordance with Section P2904 is provided, the common wall shall be not less 
than a 1-hour fire-resistance-rated wall assembly tested in accordance with ASTM E119, UL 263 or Section 703.3 of 
the International Building Code. 
2. Where a fire sprinkler system in accordance with Section P2904 is not provided, the common wall shall be not 
less than a 2-hour fire-resistance-rated wall assembly tested in accordance with ASTM E119, UL 263 or Section 
703.3 of the International Building Code. 
R302.2.3 Continuity. The fire-resistance-rated wall or assembly separating townhouses, or two-family dwellings 
with the units separated by a lot line, shall be continuous from the foundation to the underside of the roof sheathing, 
deck or slab. The fire-resistance rating shall extend the full length of the wall or assembly, including wall extensions 
through and separating attached enclosed accessory structures. 
R302.2.4 Parapets for townhouses and two-family dwellings with units separated by a lot line. Parapets 
constructed in accordance with Section R302.2.5 shall be constructed for townhouses and for two-family dwellings 
with units separated by a lot line as an extension of exterior walls or common walls in accordance with the 
following: 
1. Where roof surfaces adjacent to the wall or walls are at the same elevation, the parapet shall extend not less than 
30 inches (762 mm) above the roof surfaces. 
2. Where roof surfaces adjacent to the wall or walls are at different elevations and the higher roof is not more than 
30 inches (762 mm) above the lower roof, the parapet shall extend not less than 30 inches (762 mm) above the lower 
roof surface. 
Exception: A parapet is not required in the preceding two cases where the roof covering complies with a minimum 
Class C rating as tested in accordance with ASTM E108 or UL 790 and the roof decking or sheathing is of 
noncombustible materials or fire-retardant-treated wood for a distance of 4 feet (1219 mm) on each side of the wall 



or walls, or one layer of 5/8-inch (15.9 mm) Type X gypsum board is installed directly beneath the roof decking or 
sheathing, supported by not less than nominal 2-inch (51 mm) ledgers attached to the sides of the roof framing 
members, for a distance of not less than 4 feet (1219 mm) on each side of the wall or walls and any openings or 
penetrations in the roof are not within 4 feet (1219 mm) of the common walls. Fire-retardant-treated wood shall 
meet the requirements of Sections R802.1.5 and R803.2.1.2. 
3. A parapet is not required where roof surfaces adjacent to the wall or walls are at different elevations and the 
higher roof is more than 30 inches (762 mm) above the lower roof. The common wall construction from the lower 
roof to the underside of the higher roof deck shall have not less than a 1-hour fire-resistance rating. The wall shall be 
rated for exposure from both sides. 
R302.2.5 Parapet construction. Parapets shall have the same fire-resistance rating as that required for the 
supporting wall or walls. On any side adjacent to a roof surface, the parapet shall have noncombustible faces for the 
uppermost 18 inches (457 mm), to include counterflashing and coping materials. Where the roof slopes toward a 
parapet at slopes greater than 2 units vertical in 12 units horizontal (16.7-percent slope), the parapet shall extend to 
the same height as any portion of the roof within a distance of 3 feet (914 mm), and the height shall be not less than 
30 inches (762 mm). 
R302.2.6 Structural independence. Each individual townhouse, and all two-family dwellings with the units 
separated by a lot line, shall be structurally independent. 
Exceptions: 
1. Foundations supporting exterior walls or common walls. 
2. Structural roof and wall sheathing from each unit fastened to the common wall framing. 
3. Nonstructural wall and roof coverings. 
4. Flashing at termination of roof covering over common wall. 
5. Townhouses separated by a common wall as provided in Section R302.2.2, Item 1 or 2. 
R302.3 Two-family dwellings not divided by a lot line. Dwelling units in two-family dwellings that will not be 
separated from each other by a lot line shall be separated from each other by wall and floor assemblies having not 
less than a 1-hour fire-resistance rating where tested in accordance with ASTM E119, UL 263 or Section 703.3 of 
the International Building Code. Fire resistance-rated floor/ceiling and wall assemblies shall extend to and be tight 
against the exterior wall(s), foundation, and underside of the roof sheathing, as applicable, to provide a complete 1-
hour fire-resistance rated barrier between the two units (including any associated basements, crawl spaces, attics, 
garages, and attached accessory structures.), and wall assemblies shall extend from the foundation to the underside 
of the roof sheathing. 
Exceptions: 
1. A fire-resistance rating of 1/2 hour shall be permitted in buildings equipped throughout with an automatic 
sprinkler system installed in accordance with NFPA 13. 
2. Wall assemblies need not extend through attic spaces where the ceiling is protected by not less than 5/8-inch (15.9 
mm) Type X gypsum board, an attic draft stop constructed as specified in Section R302.12.1 is provided above and 
along the wall assembly separating the dwellings and the structural framing supporting the ceiling is protected by not 
less than 1/2-inch (12.7 mm) gypsum board or equivalent. 
R302.3.1 Supporting construction. Where floor assemblies are required to be fire-resistance rated by Section 
R302.3, the supporting construction of such assemblies shall have an equal or greater fire-resistance rating. 



                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                     
                                                             CITY OF CODY BUILDING PERMITS FOR SEPTEMBER 2018                                                                                                                                                  
                                                                                                                                                                                                                           
                                                                                                                                                                                                                           

Permit Number                                 Applicant                        Property Address            Description of Work                                                                           Permit Category                        Total Valuation Total Fees

BLD-0918-0009                                 DAN MCDONALD CONSTRUCTION        3207 HARDPAN AVENUE         NEW SINGLE FAMILY RESIDENCE                                                       New Single Family Dwelling (1) 130,000.00 2,377.00
BLD-0918-0021 FILNER CONSTRUCTION, INC. 1504 21ST STREET NEW SINGLE FAMILY RESIDENCE                                                       New Single Family Dwelling (1) 270,000.00 2,045.00
BLD-0918-0025 WERNER CONSTRUCTION, LLC 2002 GLENN AVENUE NEW SINGLE FAMILY RESIDENCE                                                       New Single Family Dwelling (1) 200,000.00 1,654.00
Total = 3 Total 600,000.00 6,076.00

BLD-0918-0004                                 VAN DEER CUSTOM CONSTRUCTION     1019 ALGER AVENUE           REMODEL RESIDENTIAL HOME                                                                      Single Family Additions/Alterations (3) 105,000.00 1,122.00
BLD-0918-0014                                 SCHNIEDER, GINA                  916 CANYON AVENUE           REMODEL& RENOVATION OF SINGLE FAMILY DWELLING                                                 Single Family Additions/Alterations (3) 18,000.00 293.00
BLD-0918-0015                                 BURNS, DUSTIN                    102 MONTE VISTA AVENUE      BATHROOM REMODEL                                                                              Single Family Additions/Alterations (3) 450.00 24.00
BLD-0918-0024                                 M&K CUSTOM WOOD                  1032 BLEISTEIN AVENUE       ADD ON 2ND FLOOR AND ROOF                                                                     Single Family Additions/Alterations (3) 38,000.00 623.00
BLD-0918-0027                                 J. DURHAM, LLC                   1318 SALSBURY AVENUE        DEMO BATHROOM AND REMODEL                                                                     Single Family Additions/Alterations (3) 8,000.00 153.00
BLD-0918-0032                                 COUTLEY, JOHN & NANCY TRUST      1519 ALGER AVENUE           GARAGE CONVERSION INTO ACCESSORY DWELLING                                                                       Single Family Additions/Alterations (3) 25,000.00 1,006.00
Total = 6 Total 194,450.00 3,221.00

BLD-0918-0031                                 TUNDRA GENERAL CONTRACTORS, LLC  2101 SHERIDAN AVENUE        CONSTRUCT 60 X 130 METAL BUILDING                                                               New Commercial (9)                     625,000.00 12,749.00
Total = 1 Total 625,000.00 12,749.00

BLD-0918-0012                                 COWAN CONSTRUCTION               1825 17TH STREET            DEMO WALLS FOR WELLS FARGO BANK IN ALBERTSON                                                  Commercial Additions/Alterations (10)  35,000.00 492.00
BLD-0918-0016                                 DOLLAR TREE STORES               532 YELLOWSTONE AVENUE      EXPANSION OF EXISTING DOLLAR TREE STORE #3679                                                 Commercial Additions/Alterations (10)  78,200.00 1,143.00
BLD-0918-0018                                 SPRAGUE CONSTRUCTION ROOFING LLC 720 SHERIDAN AVENUE         PLAINS INDIAN RE-ROOF                                                                         Commercial Additions/Alterations (10)  216,322.03 1,649.00
BLD-0918-0022                                 M&K CUSTOM WOOD                  1131 13TH STREET            REMOVE DOOR AND HANG CABINETS.                                                                Commercial Additions/Alterations (10)  3,000.00 83.00
Total = 4 Total 332,522.03 3,367.00

BLD-0918-0001                                 SIGN PRODUCTS, INC               1007 12TH STREET            INSTALL ILLUMINATED INDIVIDUAL LETTERS ON WALL                                                Miscellaneous (11)                     6,226.00 139.00
BLD-0918-0002                                 DONNELLY DESIGNS                 1501 BECK AVENUE            REPLACE FIVE BASEMENT WINDOWS                                                                 Miscellaneous (11)                     5,000.00 15.00
BLD-0918-0003                                 HART, ZACHORY W. & LACEY M.      2406 STOLT STREET           INSTALL WOOD BURNING STOVE / PIPE                                                             Miscellaneous (11)                     1,320.00 15.00
BLD-0918-0005                                 HIGH COUNTRY ROOFING, INC        1107 BLEISTEIN AVENUE       RESIDENTIAL RE-ROOF                                                                           Miscellaneous (11)                     6,000.00 50.00
BLD-0918-0006                                 JESS' ROOFING, INC               613 16TH STREET             COMMERCIAL ROOF - REPLACE W/ASPHALT SHINGLES                                                  Miscellaneous (11)                     34,845.00 492.00
BLD-0918-0007                                 JESS' ROOFING, INC               930 CANYON AVENUE           RESIDENTIAL RE-ROOF                                                                           Miscellaneous (11)                     12,300.00 50.00
BLD-0918-0008                                 JESS' ROOFING, INC               2401 DAVIDSON AVENUE        REPLACE HOUSE & GARAGE ROOF W/ ASPHALT SHINGLES                                               Miscellaneous (11)                     9,600.00 50.00
BLD-0918-0010                                 HIGH COUNTRY ROOFING, INC        15 MASHIE CLUB              RESIDENTIAL RE-ROOF                                                                           Miscellaneous (11)                     15,100.00 50.00
BLD-0918-0011                                 JRP CONSTRUCTION, LLC            916 CANYON AVENUE           REMODEL EXISTING HOME                                                                         Miscellaneous (11)                     2,500.00 83.00
BLD-0918-0013                                 SPRAGUE CONSTRUCTION ROOFING LLC 1119 SAGE BRUSH STREET      RESIDENTIAL RE-ROOF                                                                           Miscellaneous (11)                     7,693.84 50.00
BLD-0918-0017                                 JESS' ROOFING, INC               2508 CENTRAL AVENUE         REPLACE HOUSE AND GARAGE FOOFS WITH ASHPHALT SHINGLES                                         Miscellaneous (11)                     10,960.00 50.00
BLD-0918-0019                                 HOLLINGER, JOSHUA D.             1308 WYOMING AVENUE         RESIDENTIAL RE-ROOF                                                                           Miscellaneous (11)                     1,000.00 50.00
BLD-0918-0020                                 SPRAGUE CONSTRUCTION ROOFING LLC 1820 BECK AVENUE            RE-ROOF                                                                                       Miscellaneous (11)                     7,911.21 50.00
BLD-0918-0023                                 S & S NIELSEN, LLC               341 24TH STREET             INSTALL SECURITY FENCE Miscellaneous (11)                     28,000.00 422.00
BLD-0918-0026                                 KOEHLER, BRANDON & WHITNEY       2502 BEARTOOTH DRIVE        INSTALL EGRESS WINDOW IN BASEMENT BEDROOM.                                                    Miscellaneous (11)                     1,000.00 15.00
BLD-0918-0028                                 MCG'S ROOFING, LLC               1019 ALPINE AVENUE          TEAR OFF AND RE-ROOF                                                                          Miscellaneous (11)                     9,700.00 50.00
BLD-0918-0029                                 MCG'S ROOFING, LLC               2132 SHOSHONI TRAIL NORTH   TEAR OFF AND RE-ROOF                                                                          Miscellaneous (11)                     10,400.00 50.00



BLD-0918-0030                                 MCG'S ROOFING, LLC               1143 SALSBURY AVENUE        TEAR OFF AND RE-ROOF                                                                          Miscellaneous (11)                     8,600.00 50.00
DM-0918-0001                                  ZACH OF ALL TRADES               1826 ALGER AVENUE           DEMO HOUSE                                                                                    Miscellaneous (11)                     10,000.00 50.00
FNC-0918-0001                                 KENDALL ENTERPRISES, LLC         1901 MOUNTAIN VIEW DRIVE    T-POST WITH ONE WIRE                                                                          Miscellaneous (11)                     200.00 15.00
FNC-0918-0002                                 HARWELL, JESS & JUDY             632 TRI-POWER COURT         INSTALL 6' CEDAR PRIVACY FENCE AROUND BACK YARD                                               Miscellaneous (11)                     3,000.00 15.00
FNC-0918-0003                                 PECK, BILL & CAROL               3031 LAME DEER AVENUE       EXTEND FENCE 5'-10"                                                                           Miscellaneous (11)                     200.00 15.00
SP-0918-0001                                  CHUCK'S SIGN CO. L.L.C.          1130 SHERIDAN AVENUE        RE BRANDING OF BANK AND SIGNS Miscellaneous (11)                     3,000.00 83.00
SP-0918-0002                                  CHUCK'S SIGN CO. L.L.C.          532 YELLOWSTONE AVENUE      INSTALL 25' FREESTANDING SIGN                                                                 Miscellaneous (11)                     3,000.00 97.00
SP-0918-0003                                  CHUCK'S SIGN CO. L.L.C.          1022 13TH STREET            REMOVE PART OF EXISTING AWNING, INSTALL NEW SIGN                         Miscellaneous (11)                     3,000.00 83.00
Total = 25 Total 200,556.05 2,089.00

PLB-0918-0001                                 PENROSE PLUMBING & HEATING       813 OUTLOOK COURT           REPLACE FURNACE, COIL, AND CONDENSING UNIT                                                    Plumbing (12)                          5,200.00 15.00
PLB-0918-0002                                 PREFERRED PLUMBING & HEATING, LLC 2337 CENTRAL AVENUE         RE-PIPE GAS LINES AND NEW METER BASE                                                          Plumbing (12)                          2,000.00 15.00
PLB-0918-0003                                 HAL LEE PLUMBING & HEATING       206 C STREET                GAS LINE INSPECTION (FOR SHARON NADING)                                                       Plumbing (12)                          1,200.00 15.00
PLB-0918-0004                                 PENROSE PLUMBING & HEATING       1220 SUNSHINE AVENUE        REDO SOME PLUMBING LINES AND INSTALL NEW SINK / FAUCET                                        Plumbing (12)                          2,000.00 50.00
PLB-0918-0005                                 DEMARANVILLE, NICOLE & BRIAN     719 LINKS VIEW DRIVE        INSTALL PLUMBING ON NEW RESIDENCE                                                             Plumbing (12)                          12,000.00 25.00
PLB-0918-0006                                 HAL LEE PLUMBING & HEATING       2413 CENTRAL AVENUE         ADD TANKLESS WATER HEATER                                                                     Plumbing (12)                          3,200.00 15.00
PLB-0918-0007                                 BETTER COMFORT SOLUTIONS, LLC    1038 CANYON AVENUE          FURANCE REPLACEMENT                                                                           Plumbing (12)                          3,000.00 15.00
PLB-0918-0008                                 HAL LEE PLUMBING & HEATING       2304 GREEVER STREET         REPLACE WATER HEATER                                                                        Plumbing (12)                          1,100.00 15.00
PLB-0918-0009 PREFERRED PLUMBING & HEATING, LLC 2304 GREEVER STREET         REPLACE WATER HEATER                                                                         Plumbing (12)                          1,000.00 15.00
PLB-0918-0010 PREFERRED PLUMBING & HEATING, LLC 1108 SALSBURY AVENUE INSTALL HEAT, BOILERS, AND PIPING Plumbing (12)                          15,000.00 15.00
PLB-0918-0011                                 BIG HORN HEATING & COOLING INC.  1614 11TH STREET            INSTALLATION OF FURNANCE AND AIR CONDITIONER                                                  Plumbing (12)                          8,243.00 15.00
PLB-0918-0012                                 AIR CON REFRIGERATION            808 12TH STREET             INSTALL NEW HEAT AND COOL UNIT                                                                Plumbing (12)                          11,000.00 100.00
PLB-0918-0013                                 BIG HORN HEATING & COOLING INC.  2620 HOLLER AVENUE          INSTALLATION OF FURNACE AND DUCTING                                                           Plumbing (12)                          8,569.00 15.00
Total = 13 Total 73,512.00 325.00

ELC-0918-0001 YELLOWSTONE ELECTRIC             3004 HARDPAN AVENUE         ELECTRICAL FOR NEW HOUSE                                                                      Electrical (13)                        12,000.00 50.00
ELC-0918-0002 CODY ELECTRIC CONTRACTOR, LLC    1625 STAMPEDE AVENUE        REPLACE LIGHTS - COMMERCIAL BUILDING                                                          Electrical (13)                        18,000.00 100.00
ELC-0918-0003 BUCK'N HORSE ELECTRIC            3207 HARDPAN AVENUE         ELECTRIC FOR NEW HOUSE                                                                        Electrical (13)                        12,000.00 50.00
ELC-0918-0004 BUCK'N HORSE ELECTRIC            2337 CENTRAL AVENUE         INSTALL 3 NEW RECEPTACLES, CEILING FAN, & OUTSIDE LIGHTS                                      Electrical (13)                        1,200.00 25.00
ELC-0918-0005 CODY ELECTRIC CONTRACTOR, LLC    2431 CENTRAL AVENUE         ELECTRICAL FOR NEW HOUSE                                                                      Electrical (13)                        10,000.00 50.00
ELC-0918-0006 CODY ELECTRIC CONTRACTOR, LLC    1825 17TH STREET            TEAR OUT AND REINSTALL LIGHTS (AT WELLS FARGO SECTION)                                        Electrical (13)                        2,000.00 50.00
ELC-0918-0007 SECURE ELECTRICAL SERVICES, LLC  1302 ALGER AVENUE           INSTALL NEW ELECTRICAL FEED FORM SECONDARY PEDISTAL                                          Electrical (13)                        3,000.00 95.00
ELC-0918-0008 CODY ELECTRIC CONTRACTOR, LLC    1038 CANYON AVENUE HOOK UP FURNACE Electrical (13)                        250.00 25.00
ELC-0918-0009 BUCK'N HORSE ELECTRIC            1318 SALSBURY AVENUE ELECTRIC FOR BATHROOM REMODEL Electrical (13)                        800.00 25.00
ELC-0918-0010 CODY ELECTRIC CONTRACTOR, LLC    1825 17TH STREET            ADD EL OUTLET FOR ATM AND LIQUOR STORE Electrical (13)                        450.00 25.00
ELC-0918-0011 ELECTRICAL ALLY, INC             1614 11TH STREET            WIRING FOR FURNANCE                                                                           Electrical (13)                        300.00 25.00
Total = 11 Total 60,000.00 520.00

Total Permits = 63 Total Valuation and Fees 2,086,040.08 28,347.00












	MECO_License_Application.pdf
	MECO_Reference_Letters.pdf
	MECO_Reference_Letters
	Modern_Reference


	September Building Permits Report - web.pdf
	ADPFB38.tmp
	September Building Permit Summa





